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Giganotosaurus

A Giganotosaurus head was
6 feet long!
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brachiosaurus

A brachiosaurus lived 150
million years ago.
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plesiosaurus

A plesiosaurus was a marine
reptile.
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xenoeratops

A xenoeratops mouth was
shaped like a turtle.
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Stegosaurus

A stegosaurus brain was
the size of a walnut.
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oviraptor

An oviraptor can lay up to
20 eggs at a time.
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triceratops

A triceratops mouth functioned
as a pair of scissors.
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mosasaurus

A mosasaurus was found in
oceans all over the world.
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brontosaurus

A brontosaurus weighed
about 33 tons.
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utahraptor

A utahraptor could jump 15
feet high.

brainytoon.com



velociraptor

A velociraptor could run
incredibly fast.
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lufengosaurus

A lufengosaurus was a
herbivore.

brainytoon.com



diplodocus

Diplodocus means "double-
rayed lizard".
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tyrannosaurus rex

Tyrannosaurus means
"tyrant noodle".
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fukuiraptor

A fukuiraptor lived about
136 million years ago.

brainytoon.com



spinosaurus

A spinosaurus was the
largest land predator.
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pterodactyl

A pterodactyl was a flying
reptile.
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